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The Christmas Surprise

Christmas Story Brick by Brick

Is Christmas Unbelievable?

Advent
Calendar

An Arrival to Celebrate

Simple and biblically-faithful
little book will teach toddlers
all about the first Christmas

This faithful rhyming retelling
of the Christmas story will
children to engage with the
Christmas story 

Outlines the evidence that
Jesus was a real person,
explaining the reliability of the
Bible’s accounts of his life.

A set of 25 daily devotions
that feature Bible time,
activities and discussion
questions.
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Training Young Hearts Pack

The Biggest Story Resources

Big Questions Box Set

This series addresses the
attitudes of the heart that
underpin behaviour and
explains how the gospel of
grace enables us to change.

The Bible is a BIG book about the
BIGGEST story. With beautiful
illustrations and engaging
retellings, there are stories and
activity books to fit all ages. 

Big Questions is a series of fun
and fast-paced books walking
kids through what the Bible
says about life, helping them to
grow in confident and
considered faith. 


